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G1" Val ional Pharmacy Week (NPW)-202" 

A REPORT ON TECHNICAL EVENTI61" NATIONAL PHARMACY WEEK 

CONDUCTED ON 24h-25th NOVEMBER, 22 AT NETAJI OPEN AIR AUDITORIUM 
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Dr. B. C. Roy college of Pharmacy and Allied Health Sciences successfully celebrated National 
Pharmacy week on 24h November 2022 and 25th November 2022 in the college campus. On 24 
November, 2022, a free health check-up camp was conducted in Netaji Open Air Auditorium in 
joint collaboration with Pharmacist Association, West Bengal, and Paschim Bardhhaman. The 
program began with the lighting of the ceremonial lamp and an opening song sung by Mrs. 
Sushruta Chakraborty which was followed by a welcoming address by Prof. Dr. S. Chakraborty, 
Director. Dr. Dhiman Mandal, Superintendent, S.D. Hospital, Durgapur, further delivered a talk 
on the importance of National Pharmacy week and declared the event open after which the free 
health check-up camp started. 
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The second day's program was conducted in joint collaboration with Indian Pharmaceutical 
Association, Bengal Branch, and the venue being APC Roy Auditorium. The program was 
attended by eminent personalities of the IPA. The program began with the lighting of the 
ceremonial lamp and a welcoming speech delivered to the audience by Prof. Dr. S. Chakraborty, 
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Director. This was followed by a talk by Dr. Soumendra Darbar, Deputy Manager, and Dey's 
Medical Stores who spoke about the Indian Pharmaceutical Association. Mr. Pradip Kr. Mallik, 
General Manager, Burnet Pharmaceuticals Pvt. Ltd., also delivered a talk on Pharmacy week and 
motivated the young budding Pharmacists. The session was also addressed by Basudev Paul, 
Assistant Director, and Drug Control. An inter-college quiz competition was also hosted by the 
college where students from different colleges participated to celebrate the National Pharmacy 
Week. The two-day- event of National Pharmacy Week ended witha vote of thanks delivered by 

Mrs. Rituparna Chaki Ghosh. 
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